November 20, 2000

Five Story Wood-Frame Construction

Model Ordinance

Goal: To provide jurisdictions a model ordinance allowing five-story wood frame construction.

Background: The issue of allowing five-story wood frame construction was raised at the housing retreat and staff researched the issue. While not currently incorporated into the Uniform Building Code, five-story wood frame construction is allowed in Seattle, Portland, Tacoma and Everett. Many other jurisdictions that have adopted the Uniform Building Code [UBC] are looking at the potential for increasing the density of development in their core centers as well as trying to optimize the usage of smaller building sites in these areas. The UBC allows for the use of alternative materials and methods of construction when comparability is maintained. 

The issue of five-story wood frame construction first was discussed this summer in a joint meeting of King County Planning Directors and Building Officials. After a lengthy discussion many agreed that five-story wood frame construction could be allowed through the alternative materials and methods provisions.  A team of building officials then prepared and following additional discussions refined the ordinance. In late October, a draft ordinance was made available at a session of the Washington Association of Building Officials. In addition a similar ordinance has been reviewed by the Washington State Housing Authority staff and they have confirmed that local jurisdictions have the authority to adopt such regulations.  At this time,  no flaws have been found in the technical content, legal authority or process. Fire department personnel from several cities have also reviewed the proposed ordinance and have been supportive of the approach to fire safety that it has taken. 

Proposed Model Ordinance: The concept behind this model ordinance is that the building’s own fire safety features should afford occupants the same level of safely that occupants of a four- story wood frame building are afforded. Every effort has been made to avoid changes to the UBC with regard to fire-life-safety and only those requirements pertaining directly to the impacts of an additional wood frame story are amended. The ordinance also seeks to be flexible to allow for consistency with other local code provisions. For example, the ordinance uses a height restriction of 65 feet since many jurisdictions impose high rise construction standards at that height. Should a local jurisdiction have a greater height provision; the draft ordinance could be easily modified to reflect the greater standard.

In summary the model ordinance contains the following provisions:

· Allows five stories of wood frame construction over Type 1 fire resistant construction

· The total allowable building area is increased by 25%

· Height is limited to 65 feet [or as locally modified] as measured in the UBC 

· Business, Mercantile and Reisdential-1 occupancies are allowed on any floor

· The first story of wood construction is required to be protected by 2-hour fire resistive construction

· Exit enclosures are protected by 2-hour fire resistive construction

· Pressurization is required in the exit enclosures and elevator shafts

· The building must have a minimum of one elevator

· Stand-by power in the form of an on-site generator is required and it must be large enough to run the emergency systems

· Structural observation is required by the engineer of record for structural frame elements.

Jurisdictional Uses: It is the intent of this work to provide jurisdictions a means to allow five-story wood frame construction. While the additional story could reduce the price of individual residential units, this ordinance should be looked upon more as a means to increasing housing density. Jurisdictions need to individually determine if five-story wood frame construction is consistent with their adopted policies and whether or not they want to allow five-story wood frame construction. Staff understands that a number of jurisdictions are prepared to consider the adoption of the model ordinance. 

GMPC Action: Staff requests that the GMPC discuss the model ordinance and direct that it is included in future GMPC model/best housing practices manuals. 

ORDINANCE NO.___________

An Ordinance amending the [      ]

Building Code relating to alternate methods of design and construction of 

mixed-use buildings, amending Ordinance No. ___________.

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that it is the City’s desire to provide additional tools to build economically viable mixed-use and multi-family buildings; and

WHEREAS, the City has reviewed various methods of providing high density uses which involve among other things, outreach to other communities including the cities of Seattle, Tacoma, Olympia and Everett, Washington, and the cities of Portland and Beaverton, Oregon; and

WHEREAS, the City Council finds the Uniform Building Code allows for the approval of alternate material, methods of design, and methods of construction; and

WHEREAS, the City solicited input from local technical professionals who recommended adoption of alternate methods and materials to allow an additional story of wood frame construction for mixed-use and multi-family buildings, provided specific design and inspection standards are met, and

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that providing this alternate method of construction should provide an incentive for the construction of economically viable mixed-use and residential occupancies within the downtown which is consistent with the City’s Comprehensive Plan land use element policies which provide for high density uses in the downtown as well as a variety of other areas;

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY OF ________ DOES ORDAIN:

Section 1: That Ordinance No.         (Chapter[       ] ) is hereby amended by the addition of the following section:

A-Purpose-General

It is the purpose of this section to authorize the alternate design and construction of five-story wood framed buildings.  Based upon recommendations of technical professionals, pursuant to Section 104.2.8 of the 1997 Edition of The Uniform Building Code as presently constituted or as may be subsequently amended, as adopted as part of the    [     ] City Code ([      ] Chapter [  ] ), the Building Official approves as an alternate design and method of construction five-story wood framed provided: (1) the proposed design is satisfactory and complies with the provisions of the Uniform Building Code (UBC) and the material, method and work offered is, for the purpose intended, at least the equivalent of that prescribed in the Uniform Building Code in suitability, strength, effectiveness, fire resistance, durability, safety and sanitation; and (2) sufficient evidence or proof has been submitted to substantiate the alternate design and construction.

B-Construction.

Five-story wood framed buildings shall be constructed such that the lowest Type V story shall be constructed as detailed below, and the upper four stories constructed of at least Type V 1-hour construction.  Where Type V, five-story wood framed buildings are constructed over Type 1 construction, the Type V construction shall be separated as required in UBC section 311.2.2.1, 1997 Edition as presently constituted or as may be subsequently amended.

Construction Types.  Type I and Type V 1-hour hall be as specified in the Uniform Building Code.  Type V 1-hour construction where all structural frame and load bearing elements consist of approved two-hour fire-resistive construction shall comprise the first story of wood framed construction.

C-Occupancy.

Occupancy of five-story wood frame buildings shall be as allowed in Table 5-B, UBC, 1997 Edition as presently constituted or as may be subsequently amended, except B, M, and R-1 occupancies shall be allowed on any floor.

Occupancies shall be as defined in the 1997 Edition of the Uniform Building Code.

D-Stair Enclosures.

Where buildings are designed and constructed pursuant to this section, all stair enclosures shall be of two-hour construction having 1 1/2-hour opening protection.

All buildings constructed in accordance with this Section shall be provided a minimum of one elevator with a car which complies with Section 3003.5 of the Uniform Building Code. 

E-Fire Detection and Protection.

Buildings designed and constructed pursuant to this section shall be protected throughout by an automatic fire sprinkler system complying with U.B.C Standard 9-1 (NFPA 13) as contained in the 1997 Uniform Building Code and further modified in the State Building Code.  The automatic fire sprinkler system shall not substitute for 1-hour construction nor shall automatic fire sprinklers be used to increase the number of stories. 

All stair enclosures and elevator shafts shall be pressurized as required in UBC sections 905.3.2 and 905.5.3.3, as presently constituted or as may be subsequently amended.  In addition a class I standpipe system as required by UBC section 904.5 and UBC Standard 9-2, as presently constituted or as may be subsequently amended, shall be installed.

A standby power-generator set shall be provided on the premises in accordance with the 1997 Uniform Building Code section 403.8.1 and the 1999 National Electrical Code as presently constituted or as may be subsequently amended.  The stand by system shall have a capacity and rating that would supply all equipment required to be operational at the same time including stair enclosure and elevator shaft pressurization and elevators.

An approved monitored manual and automatic fire detection system shall be installed throughout the building and provide alarm, trouble and supervisory monitoring of the automatic fire sprinkler system.

F-Height.

The maximum height of buildings designed and constructed pursuant to this section shall be 65 feet.  The height shall be measured as provided in the 1997 Uniform Building Code.

G-Basic Allowable Floor Area

The basic allowable area of floors of five-story wood frame buildings shall be as allowed in Table 5-B and sections 504 - 505, UBC, 1997 Edition, as presently constituted or as may be subsequently amended.  For the purpose of this article only, the total allowable area as calculated subject to the above referenced table and sections, may be increased by twenty-five percent (25%).

H-Fire Department Access.

Fire Department vehicular access for buildings designed and constructed pursuant to this section shall be approved by the Fire Chief and Building Official.

I-Construction Inspection.

The following shall be required for buildings designed and constructed pursuant to this section:

1. Structural Observation:  Structural observation provided by the engineer of record for structural frame elements; and

2. Special Inspection; Special inspections as required in the 1997 Uniform Building Code. 

J-Maintenance of Fire Protection Systems.

The owners of buildings constructed and approved under this regulation shall be responsible for assuring the fire and life-safety systems required by the Uniform Building Code and the [       ] Code are maintained in an operable condition at all times.  Unless otherwise required by the Fire Chief, testers approved by the jurisdiction having authority shall conduct yearly testing of such systems.  A written record shall be maintained and shall be forwarded to the Fire Marshal and be available to the inspection authority.

3

